11-09

L

JAM PTO-1884

. 6-83) H K D
MB No. 0651-0011 ( -b‘-f‘ts. do

Tab setnos == > v

REC(

Tothe Honcrapie Commissioner of Patenhis aiu riauciniaina.

101512187

-2000

M

U.S. DEFARTMENT OF COMMERCL
Patent and Tracemark Oftic:

HEET

v

L o e v.- —~dCNEC{ONOINAI COCUMENts OF COPY tnereot.

1. Name of conveying pany(ies):

Oshkosh Truck Corporation

< Association
2 Umned Parmership

2 Individual(s)

2 General Pannership
2 Corporaton-State
2 Cther

Agditional namers) of conveving pamyues) snacnea? J Yes & No

2. Name and address of recewving panty(ies)

Name: Bank of America, N.A., as agent

intemal Address:

Street Address: 231 S. LaSalle

City:_Chicago State: IL ZP: 60697

Q Individual(s) citzenship
@ Association

3. Nature of conveyance:

< Assignment Q Merger
Q Security Agreement Q Change of Name
X Omer_aeaf_f_;mamn_aj_ﬁmendmam_AQmemani__

Execunon Date: September 28, 2000

Q General Parnersnm
O Limited Pantnership
O Corporation-State

Q Other
1 INee 13 NOL COM N the Unitea Slales, a COMSSUT MEOITISIAUYE OSSIGNETOS:
13 anACHeA QO Yes S'No —

(Des1oNanons MUst DE B SS0ATAIS COCUMENT TOM ASGINEN)
Acamona: nameis) & aooressies! anacnea? O Yes @B No

4. Apptication number(s) or patent numoert(s):

A. Trademark Application No.(s)

B. Trademark Registrauon No.(s)

Additional numopers IMIG?XY.’ Q No

5. Name and address of pany to whom correspongdence
conceming document should be mailed:

Name: Laura Konrath

Internat Adgress: Winston & Strawn

33rd Floor

4

6. Total number of appiicauons and
registrations invoived: ..

I

7. Total fee (37 CFH 3.41) 40,00

G Enclosed

2 Authorized to be charged to deposit account

35 West Wacker Drive

Street Address:
8. Deposit account numper:
' 60601 N/A
city,__ Chicago State: -
(Aftach duptcare cooy of this page if D8VING Dy GeDasn account’
DO NOT USE THIS SPACE ¢

|

3. Statement ana signature.

To the best ¢t my knowieage ana oelief, the foregoing,
the onginal document.

Laura Konrath

AU e i el Mgl N0y

Total numoer ot paged ncrumno

lon 1s true and correct ana any anacnea copy is 4 true gopy of
signawre U Date

-

cover sneeL anacnments. anc gocument:

Mall documents to be recoraed with reoulredcawrtnect informationto:

~--..-—-.—-JD“-...- > T
ppa-tpiat ahe A

e mnrRs. SR ASSIChTETS

REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0967



AASEREETERSEEE | A TION CO \/1+f nuah N Tew, y

ERIAL NO. FILING DATE
SHKO:!
0
QOshk
OSHKOSH TRUCK CORPORATION
U.S. SERVICE MARK APPLICATIONS
SERVICEMARK SERIAL NO. FILING DATE LAWFIRM |
FAST 75/242890 2/18/97 OTC ]
6
TRADEMARK

REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0968



REAFFIRMATION AND AMENDMENT AGREEMENT
(SECURITY AGREEMENT)
(PLEDGE AGREEMENT)
(COPYRIGHT SECURITY AGREEMENT)
(PATENT SECURITY AGREEMENT)
(TRADEMARK SECURITY AGREEMENT)

This Reaffirmation and Amendment Agreement (this “Agreement”) is dated as of
September 28, 2000 and entered into by and between Oshkosh Truck Corporation (the
“Borrower”) and Bank of America, N.A. (f/k/a Bank of America National Trust and Savings
Association; “BofA”), as agent (the “Agent”).

WITNESSETH:

WHEREAS, the Borrower entered into that certain Credit Agreement dated as of
February 26, 1998 (the “Prior Credit Agreement”) with the financial institutions party thereto
(the “Lenders”) and the Agent;

WHEREAS, in connection with the execution and delivery of the Prior Credit
Agreement, the Borrower and the Agent entered into the Security Agreement (the "Security
Agreement"), the Pledge Agreement (the "Pledge Agreement"), the Copyright Security
Agreement (the "Copyright Security Agreement"), the Patent Security Agreement (the "Patent
Security Agreement") and the Trademark Security Agreement (the "Trademark Security
Agreement" and together with the Copyright Security Agreement and the Patent Security
Agreement, the "IP Security Agreements"), each dated as of February 26, 1998 (the IP Security
Agreements, together with the Security Agreement and the Pledge Agreement are referred to
herein as the "Amended Agreements");

WHEREAS, the Borrower, the Agent and the Lenders are entering into that certain
Amended and Restated Credit Agreement of even date herewith (the “Credit Agreement”);

WHEREAS, the Borrower executed certain Mortgages (as defined in the Prior Credit
Agreement) and now the Borrower desires to amend a single provision of each of the Mortgages;
and

WHEREAS, in connection with the consummation of the transactions contemplated by
the Credit Agreement, (a) the Borrower desires to reaffirm for the benefit of the Agent and the
Lenders its obligations and covenants under the Amended Agreements and (b) the Borrower and
the Agent desire to amend the Amended Agreements as herein set forth,;

NOW, THEREFORE, for good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of
which are hereby acknowledged, the parties hereto hereby agree as follows:

1. Defined Terms. Capitalized terms used herein and not otherwise defined herein shall
have the meanings attributed to such terms in the Credit Agreement.

2. Reaffirmation of Security Agreement. Notwithstanding the transactions contemplated by
the Credit Agreement, the Borrower hereby fully and unconditionally reaffirms, ratifies and

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0969




confirms (i) in all respects each and every obligation and covenant made by it in the Security
Agreement (as amended by this Agreement), which include, without limitation, the grant of
Liens in all of the Borrower's interests in the Collateral owned by it as security for the payment
and performance of the Secured Obligations (as defined in the Guaranty), (ii) that, after giving
effect to this Agreement, all of its representations and warranties made in the Security
Agreement remain true and correct as of the date of this Amendment (except to the extent that
such representations or warranties are expressly made only as of another specific date), (iii) that
the Security Agreement remains the legal, valid and binding obligation of the Borrower
enforceable against the Borrower in accordance with its terms and that such obligation shall not
be discharged by any modification, extension, renewal or amendment of the terms of the Prior
Credit Agreement, the Credit Agreement or the other L.oan Documents and (iv) that there are no
defenses, counterclaims or set-offs to the Security Agreement or the Borrower's covenants,
agreements, lhabilities and obligations thereunder and that any such defenses, counterclaims or
set-offs are hereby expressly waived. Subject to the terms and conditions of this Agreement, each
party hereto agrees that effective as of the date hereof, as used in the Security Agreement and all
related documents and agreements, each reference to “Credit Agreement” shall mean a reference
to the Credit Agreement as the same is amended, supplemented, restated or otherwise modified
from time to time.

3. Reaffirmation of Pledge Agreement. Notwithstanding the transactions contemplated by
the Credit Agreement, the Borrower hereby fully and unconditionally reaffirms, ratifies and
confirms (i) in all respects each and every obligation and covenant made by it in the Pledge
Agreement (as amended by this Agreement), which include, without limitation, the pledge of
certain shares of capital stock and promissory notes owned by it as security for the payment and
performance of the Secured Obligations (as defined in the Guaranty), (ii) that, after giving effect
to this Agreement, all of its representations and warranties made in the Pledge Agreement remain
true and correct as of the date of this Amendment (except to the extent that such representations
or warranties are expressly made only as of another specific date), (ii1) that the Pledge
Agreement remains the legal, valid and binding obligation of the Borrower enforceable against
the Borrower in accordance with its terms and that such obligation shall not be discharged by any
modification, extension, renewal or amendment of the terms of the Prior Credit Agreement, the
Credit Agreement or the other l.oan Documents and (1v) that there are no defenses,
counterclaims or set-offs to the Pledge Agreement or the Borrower's covenants, agreements,
liabilities and obligations thereunder and that any such defenses, counterclaims or set-offs are
hereby expressly waived. Subject to the terms and conditions of this Agreement, each party
hereto agrees that effective as of the date hereof, as used in the Pledge Agreement and all related
documents and agreements, each reference to “Credit Agreement” shall mean a reference to the
Credit Agreement as the same is amended, supplemented, restated or otherwise modified from
time to time.

4. Reaffirmation of IP Security Agreements. Notwithstanding the transactions
contemplated by the Credit Agreement, the Borrower hereby fully and unconditionally reaffirms,
ratifies and confirms (i) in all respects each and every obligation and covenant made by it in the
IP Security Agreements (each as amended by this Agreement), which include, without limitation,
the grant of Liens in all of the Borrower's interests in the copyrights, patents and trademarks
owned or licensed by it as security for the payment and performance of the Secured Obligations,
(ii) that, after giving effect to this Agreement, all of its representations and warranties made in

2.

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0970



the IP Security Agreements remain true and correct as of the date of this Amendment (except to
the extent that such representations or warranties are expressly made only as of another specific
date), (iii) that the IP Security Agreements remain the legal, valid and binding obligations of the
Borrower enforceable against the Borrower in accordance with their respective terms and that
such obligations shall not be discharged by any modification, extension, renewal or amendment
of the terms of the Prior Credit Agreement, the Credit Agreement or the other Loan Documents
and (iv) that there are no defenses, counterclaims or set-offs to the IP Security Agreements or the
Borrower's covenants, agreements, liabilities and obligations thereunder and that any such
defenses, counterclaims or set-offs are hereby expressly waived. Subject to the terms and
conditions of this Agreement, each party hereto agrees that effective as of the date hereof, as
used in the IP Security Agreements and all related documents and agreements, each reference to
“Credit Agreement” shall mean a reference to the Credit Agreement as the same is amended,
supplemented, restated or otherwise modified from time to time.

5. Amendments to Security Agreement. (a) The Recitals to the Security Agreement are
hereby amended by deleting Recital A in its entirety and replacing it with the following:

A Pursuant to the Credit Agreement dated as of the date hereof and amended
and restated as of September 28, 2000 among the Company, the financial institutions
from time to time party thereto (the “Lenders”) and the Agent (as further amended,
supplemented, restated or modified from time to time, the “Credit Agreement”), the
Lenders have agreed to extend certain credit to the Company.

(b) Section 7(c)(i) of the Security Agreement is hereby amended as follows:

(i) by deleting the amount "$1,500,000" found in subsection (i) and replacing it
with "$5,000,000";

(ii) by deleting the word "and" immediately preceding subsection "(y)" in the first
clause of subsection (i) and replacing it with a comma; and

(iti) by inserting the phrase "and (z) Equipment which is located outside the
territorial limits of the United States with an aggregate fair market value not in excess of
$35,000,000," in place of the comma found after the phrase "and other Guarantors)" in
subsection (1).

(¢) Schedules A, B and C to the Security Agreement are hereby amended by being
deleted in their entirety and replaced with Schedules A, B and C attached hereto.

6. Amendments to Pledge Agreement. (a) The Recitals to the Pledge Agreement are hereby
amended by deleting Recital A in its entirety and replacing it with the following:

A Pursuant to the Credit Agreement dated as of the date hereof and amended
and restated as of September 28, 2000 among the Pledgor, the financial institutions from
time to time party thereto (the “Lenders”) and the Agent (as further amended,
supplemented, restated or modified from time to time, the “Credit Agreement”), the
Lenders have agreed to extend certain credit to the Pledgor.

-3-

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0971



(b) Section 2(iv) of the Pledge Agreement is hereby amended as follows:

(i) by deleting the amount "$1,000,000" found in such subsection and replacing it
with "$5,000,000",

(ii) by deleting the amount “$7,500,000” found in such subsection and replacing it
with “$15,000,000”

7. Amendments to Copyright Security Agreement. (a) The Recitals to the Copyright
Security Agreement are hereby amended by deleting Recital A in its entirety and replacing it
with the following:

A Pursuant to the Credit Agreement dated as of the date hereof and amended
and restated as of September 28, 2000 among the Debtor, the financial institutions from
time to time party thereto (the “Lenders”) and the Agent (as further amended,
supplemented, restated or modified from time to time, the “Credit Agreement™), the
Lenders have agreed to extend certain credit to the Debtor.

(b) Section 4.4 of the Copyright Security Agreement is hereby amended by inserting the
following sentence at the end of such section:

"Delivery of existing Certificates of Registration and/or registration numbers, as
applicable, shall be made on the date hereof and delivery of Certificates of Registration and/or
registration numbers, as applicable, received after the date hereof shall be made within 105 days
after the end of each fiscal year."

(c) Section 7.5 of the Copynight Security Agreement is hereby amended by inserting the
following language immediately prior to the end of such section:

"provided, however, that the Debtor may grant non-exclusive licenses of copyrights
without the authorization or consent (written or otherwise) of the Agent or the Secured
Creditors"

8. Amendments to Patent Security Agreement. (a) The Recitals to the Patent Security
Agreement are hereby amended by deleting Recital A in its entirety and replacing it with the
following:

A Pursuant to the Credit Agreement dated as of the date hereof and amended
and restated as of September 28, 2000 among the Debtor, the financial institutions from
time to time party thereto (the “Lenders”) and the Agent (as further amended,
supplemented, restated or modified from time to time, the “Credit Agreement”), the
Lenders have agreed to extend certain credit to the Debtor.

(b) Section 4.4 of the Patent Security Agreement is hereby amended by inserting the
following sentence at the end of such section:

"Delivery of existing Certificates of Registration and/or registration numbers, as
applicable, shall be made on the date hereof and delivery of Certificates of Registration and/or

-4 -

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0972



registration numbers, as applicable, received after the date hereof shall be made within 105 days
after the end of each fiscal year."

(c) Section 7.5 of the Patent Security Agreement is hereby amended by inserting the
following language immediately prior to the end of such section:

"provided, however, that the 1Debtor may grant non-exclusive licenses of patents without
the authorization or consent (written or otherwise) of the Agent or the Secured Creditors"

9. Amendments to Trademark Security Agreement. (a) The Recitals to the Trademark
Security Agreement are hereby amended by deleting Recital A in its entirety and replacing it
with the following:

A Pursuant to the Credit Agreement dated as of the date hereof and amended
and restated as of September 28, 2000 among the Debtor, the financial institutions from
time to time party thereto (the “Lenders”) and the Agent (as further amended,
supplemented, restated or modified from time to time, the “Credit Agreement”), the
Lenders have agreed to extend certain credit to the Debtor.

(b) Section 4.4 of the Trademark Security Agreement is hereby amended by inserting the
following sentence at the end of such section:

"Delivery of existing Certificates of Registration and/or registration numbers, as
applicable, shall be made on the date hereof and delivery of Certificates of Registration and/or
registration numbers, as applicable, received after the date hereof shall be made within 105 days
after the end of each fiscal year."

(c) Section 7.5 of the Trademark Security Agreement is hereby amended by inserting the
following language immediately prior to the end of such section:

"provided, however, that the Debtor may grant non-exclusive licenses of trademarks
without the authorization or consent (written or otherwise) of the Agent or the Secured
Creditors"

10. Amendments to Mortgages. Section 3.04(¢c) of each of the Mortgages is hereby
amended by deleting the amount “$750,000” found in each such Mortgage, and replacing it with
“$5.000,000”.

11. Reference to and Effect on the Amended Agreements.

11.1 Upon the effectiveness of this Agreement, on or after the date hereof each
reference in the Amended Agreements to “this Agreement,” “hereunder,” “hereof,” “herein” or
words of like import and each reference to the applicable Amended Agreement in each Loan
Document shall mean and be a reference to the applicable Amended Agreement as amended
hereby.

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0973



11.2  The execution, delivery and effectiveness of this Agreement shall not, except as
expressly provided herein, operate as a waiver of any right, power or remedy of the Agent under
the Security Agreement.

12 CHOICE OF LAW. THIS AGREEMENT SHALL BE GOVERNED BY, AND SHALL
BE CONSTRUED AND ENFORCED IN ACCORDANCE WITH, THE INTERNAL LAWS
OF THE STATE OF ILLINOIS, WITHOUT REGARD TO CONFLICTS OF LAWS
PRINCIPLES, BUT GIVING EFFECT TO FEDERAL LAWS APPLICABLE TO NATIONAL
BANKS.

13. Execution in Counterparts. This Agreement may be executed in any number of
counterparts and by different parties hereto in separate counterparts, each of which when so
executed shall be deemed to be an original and all of which taken together shall constitute one
and the same agreement,

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0974



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, duly authorized officers of the parties hereto have executed
this Agreement as of the date first above written.

BANK OF AMERICA, N.A,, as Agent

By:

Title:

OSHKOSH TRUCK CORPORATION

Q&W\(\

Title: Vice Presiden; and Tr@:surer

744540.7

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0975



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, duly authorized officers of the parties hereto have executed
this Agreement as of the date first above written.

BANK OF AMERICA, N.A ., as Agent

By: Bwlm}@hwm

Title: DaviH ;\j Johanson
Vice-President

OSHKOSH TRUCK CORPORATION

By:

Title:

744540.7

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0976



OSHKOSH TRUCK CORPORATION

U.S. PATENTS I~
(2]
o
: « L
PATENT NAME SERIAL NO. PATENT NO. | FILING DATE DATE |LAWFIRM | g AMH
ISSUED AMH m
AiSERESORUNNENRRTeTT — SRR SRR | & T
et et I At g ——3 v _—- e m N
o
- SO o S_—— S Bue ¥
AT S P S S Pr) m
GonneERinsiitive-
el SO A lvaoner . | Digeemsen,
o
Anginssag-éc
o~
g <SS~ A - - dwiey
o cm————— o — RS T T s
Independent Coil Spring Suspension for Driven 09/232,596 6,105,984 1/19/99 8/22/00 Baker
Wheels
Independent Suspensions for Lowering Height 08/681,239 5,820,150 7/22/96 10/13/98 Baker/Foley
of Vehicle Frame
. S 2 ——vial— -~ S,
S
SefmiNaT A SOpEnE Wewd OO Bekon
ST < S S| ik | Bokei—-




OSHKOSH TRUCK CORPORATION
U.S. PATENTS APPLICATIONS

PATENT NAME SERIAL NO. FILING DATE LAW FIRM
Anti-Sway Bar Assembly 8/4/00 Baker
Control System and Method for a Snow Removal Vehicle 09/564,763 5/4/00 Foley
Equipment Service Vehicle Having On-Board Diagnostic System 09/500,506 2/9/00 Foley
Front Discharge Concrete Vehicle Cab Enclosure 09/274,895 3/23/99 Foley
Independent Suspensions 09/232,596 1/19/99 Baker
Lubrication System for a Gear Box 09/510,547 2/22/00 Foley
Military Vehicle Having Cooperative Control Network with 09/384,393 8/27/99 Foley

Distributed I/O Interfacing

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0978



OSHKOSH TRUCK CORPORATION
U.S. SERVICE MARK APPLICATIONS

SERVICEMARK

SERIAL NO.

FILING DATE

LAW FIRM

FAST

75/242850

2/18/97

OTC

TRADEMARK
REEL: 002171 FRAME: 0979

RECORDED: 10/23/2000



